
friday
5 july

CHILL OUT DAY 

INCENTRE
$76.50

Wind down for the end of 
Term 2 and enjoy watching the  
movie “SING” and hanging 
out with your friends to make 
and bake, popcorn, fruit 
kebabs and cupcakes. 

$
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WE LOOK FORWARD TO 
SEEING YOU NEXT WEEK



Monday
8 july

Tuesday
9 july

Wednesday
10 july

Thursday
11 july

Friday
12 july

TRADITIONAL TOOLS 
INDIGENOUS 
GAMES DAY 

WALKABOUT 
WILDLIFE PARK TEXTURED ART DAY DISNEY ON ICE  

EXTERNAL PROVIDER
$94.00

INTERNAL PROVIDER
$87.00

EXCURSION
$106.00

INTERNAL PROVIDER
$87.00

EXCURSION
$110.00

A day of exploring Aboriginal 
art symbols as we design and 
paint our own boomerang.  
Have time on the oval to learn 
how throw a boomerang 
safely. We will also have a go 
at weaving a basket. 

We will play various games 
learning the Aboriginal 
tradition behind the game. 
To unwind a li�le, in the 
a�ernoon we will make a clay 
pot. 

Activity starts: 10.00am 

Come and explore the 
wonders of the Great Aussie 
Bush, visit some beautiful 
bush creatures, and create 
some scented Aussie bush 
soap. Have a go at throwing a 
boomerang.

Departs: 8.30am       
Arrive: 3.30pm

Explore your artistic side and 
use your hands to create a 
work of art using a clay paint, 
sand and other materials to 
create collages and surfaces 
with varying textures of 
roughness, smoothness or 
depth.  

Mickey Mouse and his Disney 
friends embark on a wild 
ride to your favorite Disney 
destinations. Discover a 
whole new world as you’re 
swept up in Aladdin’s princely 
parade. Play at a larger-than-
life carnival with Woody and 
Forky. Join us for a fun-filled 
getaway.   

Departs: 9.30am 
Arrive: 2.00pm 

$$ $ $ $
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Monday
15 july

Tuesday
16 july

Wednesday
17 july

Thursday
18 july

Friday
19 july

OOEY GOOEY 
SLIMEFEST  GYMNASTICS OFF TO HOGWARTS KIDDY KARTZ  

LAKE MUNMORAH’S 
GOT TALENT 

EXCURSION
$94.00

INTERNAL PROVIDER
$87.00

INTERNAL PROVIDER
$87.00

INCENTRE
$76.50

EXTERNAL PROVIDER
$94.00

If you are into gooey and 
slimey activities, then today 
is for you. We will explore. 
ooblek, slime, shave cream 
paint, water beads and puff 
paint. We will also make and 
paint colored rice bubbles. 

Come and try the sport that 
Ancient Greeks developed 
and test your balance, tumble 
skills, twists and somersaults 
on floor mats while 
developing self-confidence 
exploring your gymnastic side! 

Live a day in Harry Po�er 
world, where you’ll be in a 
team identified by the edible 
cookie you receive. You will 
collect points for your team as 
we play a round robin day of 
activities. We will do a Dobby 
sock throwing comp, make 
wands, mix a potion,  play a 
Quidditch match and dig for 
treasure. 

Start your engines! With heaps 
of go karts on an inflatable 
track, kids will have the time 
of their lives racing around the 
tracks. They’ll leave the centre 
their confidence boosted and 
a new set of driving skills they 
never imagined they’d had. 

Activity starts: 10.00am 

Come dressed up (or explore 
our dress ups) and share 
your talent. Maybe be a rock 
star, a comedian, a talented 
artist. You can make props, 
instruments, whatever your 
heart desires. We might 
even make up a song for 
OSHC with our own talented 
musician Abbi. 

$$ $ $$
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